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Coronavirus infection rates: As at 30th July the number of confirmed Covid 
cases in Somerset was 26,526 (up from 20,982 on 25th June) and the number of 
Covid-attributed deaths 802. The rate per 100,000 stands at 206.9 (47.1) for 
Somerset with Mendip at 234.5 (40.7), Sedgemoor at 195.7 (74.7), South 
Somerset 214.4 (20.8) and SW&T at 187.0 (58.7). The number of total deaths 
across the County is currently 40% below the 5-year average and the latest R-
value for Somerset is between 1.3 and 1.5. 
 

Despite significant progress and even for  those who have had both jabs it is 
vitally important to remember, to observe Hands-Face-Space and to Ventilate 
indoor areas at all times. 
 
Road map out of lockdown: It is expected that the final lifting of restrictions 
including the need to self-isolate will be removed from 16th August 2021. 
Somerset Coronavirus Support Helpline: A single phone number continues to 
be available for anyone in Somerset who needs Coronavirus-related support. 
0300 790 6275, is open seven days a week from 8am to 6pm. 
 

Vaccination programme roll-out: Somerset continues to have one of the 
highest vaccination rates in the country with the latest figures showing over 
93.7% of the adult population having had one dose of vaccine and 77.4% having 
had both doses. Work continues to encourage further take up particularly 
amongst younger adults and a real focus on ensuring the second vaccine to this 
group. 
 
Local Government Reorganisation: The Secretary of State for Housing, 
Communities and Local Government (MHCLG) has delivered his decision on 
which unitary council business cases met his three tests and will therefore be 
progressed through Parliament. A single unitary met all of his clear tests 
including the ability to improve local government and services. 
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It is expected that the orders will be laid before Parliament in the late Autumn 
and a vesting date of the new authority as April 2023. Work with partners will 
now commence to progress through the transition period. 
 
Recent flooding events:  Operational staff continue to focus on the local area. 
Highways Superintendents continue to inspect the wider geographic area.  Minor 
rural roads will continue to be inspected to understand the full extent of the 
network damage. Where necessary actioning defects and/or formalising road 
closures. This is proving to be a considerable task.  Safety gangs assigned to this 
area to respond Highway Superintendent requests. 
 
Tick warning: With the warmer weather come ticks, which thrive in woodland, 
long grass and even urban parks. SCC has put together a ‘tick list’ to follow to 
reduce the risk of being bitten including: Walking on clearly defined paths, 
wearing light coloured clothing, using an insect repellent, wearing long trousers 
and long-sleeved tops to reduce the skin exposure and carrying out a regular tick 
check after outdoor activities. Being bitten by a tick doesn’t usually require 
hospital treatment but people are advised to dial NHS 111 if they start to feel 
unwell. 
 
County-wide Bus Services: Following the Government’s announcement in 
March of the new National Bus Strategy – ‘Bus Back Better’ a £3 billion pot of 
funding is being made available to improve bus services across the country and 
Somerset County Council can bid for a share of this in partnership with 
operators. But first, the Council needs to know about residents’ experience and 
where the gaps in services are.   You can take the survey at 
https://somerset.inconsult.uk/somerset.bus.survey/consultationHome 
 
Reflections of the pandemic: The Somerset Library Service is inviting people to 
share their experiences of the last sixteen months, to be recorded for future 
generations. As part of ‘Reflections’, a county-wide creative response to the 
pandemic, libraries will host a series of free drop-in sessions throughout August 
and online via social media. The collaborative artwork and film will be given to 
the South West Heritage Trust as a ‘record’ of the experiences of Somerset 
people during the pandemic. The film and artwork will then be showcased at the 
evening ‘Reflections’ event to be held on the 10 September. This initiative forms 
part of Somerset Libraries’ response to initiative, funded by The BBC and Arts 
Council England. 

Summer holidays school meals support: The Department of Work and 
Pensions has extended its Covid Local Support Grant, providing £1.4m to 
Somerset County Council who will use the grant to fund food vouchers worth 
£15 per week for children eligible for Free School Meals over the six-week 
Summer Holidays. SCC has been working to tackle holiday hunger during the 
pandemic, providing funding for food and vouchers over the October, February, 
and May half-term periods, as well as the Christmas and Easter holidays. 

Forecast heat wave: Many forecasters are expecting temperatures to rise again 
in August and so Somerset’s Public Health have issue the following important 
advice: Look out for others, especially older people, young children and babies 
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and those with underlying health conditions. Stay cool indoors: open windows 
when the air feels cooler outside than inside; shade or cover windows exposed to 
direct sunlight; move to a cooler part of the house, especially for sleeping. Keep 
drinks within easy reach – water is better than sugary or caffeinated drinks for 
staying hydrated. Avoid excess alcohol. Never leave anyone in a closed, 
parked vehicle, especially infants, young children or animals. Try to keep out of 
the sun between 11am to 3pm. 

National Recognition: Somerset County Council has been shortlisted for three 
prestigious national awards in recognition of its work during the coronavirus 
pandemic. The categories include; ‘Best Workforce Transformation’ for its 
redeployment work during the pandemic, ‘Community Heroes’ for the work of 
Community Council for Somerset’s Village and Community Agents, and 
‘Delivering Better Outcomes’ for Somerset’s Micro-providers, independent care 
providers who proved a lifeline for Somerset’s isolated rural population 
throughout the pandemic. 


